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Mayur Shitole <shitolemayur96@gmail.com> Thu, Apr 4, 2024 at 11:23 AM

To: Editor 1JZ] <editor_ijzi@hotmail.com>
Respected sir,

May | know the current status of my submitted manuscript titled "Preliminary studies on low-cost laboratory culture
method for Daphnia"?

Title: Preliminary studies on low-cost laboratory culture method for Daphnia

Corresponding author: Mr. Mayur Shitole (Assistant Prof.)

Affiliation: Department of Zoology, Tuljaram Chaturchand College of Arts, Science and Commerce, Baramati
Date of submission:- 2nd February, 2023

Thank you.

Best regards,

Mr. Mayur Shitole

Assistant Professor,

Tuljaram Chaturchand College,
Baramati- 413102

[Quoted text hidden]

Editor 1JZI <editor_ijzi@hotmail.com> Fri, Apr 5, 2024 at 10:23 AM

To: Mayur Shitole <shitolemayur96@gmail.com>

Still working on it.

From: Mayur Shitole <shitolemayur96@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 4, 2024 11:23 AM
[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

Mayur Shitole <shitolemayur96@gmail.com> Tue, May 7, 2024 at 1:56 PM

To: Editor 1JZ] <editor_ijzi@hotmail.com>
Respected sir,

May | know the current status of my submitted manuscript titled "Preliminary studies on low-cost laboratory culture
method for Daphnia™?

Title: Preliminary studies on low-cost laboratory culture method for Daphnia

Corresponding author: Mr. Mayur Shitole (Assistant Prof.)

Affiliation: Department of Zoology, Tuljaram Chaturchand College of Arts, Science and Commerce, Baramati
Date of submission:- 2nd February, 2023

Thank you.

Best regards,

Mr. Mayur Shitole

Assistant Professor,

Tuljaram Chaturchand College,
Baramati- 413102

[Quoted text hidden]

Editor 1JZI <editor_ijzi@hotmail.com> Thu, May 16, 2024 at 10:35 PM

To: Mayur Shitole <shitolemayur96@gmail.com>

Dear Dr. ,
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I am happy to inform you that your manuscript has been accepted for publication in International
Journal of Zoological Investigations. Please find attached herewith the Invoice and CTA. Kindly return
these documents within 48 hours.

If the manuscript exceeds more than 10 printed pages an extra Rs. 2000 has to be paid for which
information would be sent along with proof.

Please inform me after receiving this e-mail.
Best wishes,

Prof. Ajai K. Srivastav

Editor-in-Chief

International Journal of Zoological Investigations
Emeritus Professor

Fellow of National Academy of Sciences, India
Department of Zoology

DDU Gorakhpur University,

Gorakhpur 273 009, India

From: Mayur Shitole <shitolemayur96@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, February 2, 2024 12:15 PM

To: editor_ijzi@hotmail.com <editor_ijzi@hotmail.com>

Subject: Manuscript submission to International Journal of Zoological Investigations_Preliminary studies on low-
cost laboratory culture method for Daphnia

[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments

@ CTA Form Mayur Shitole.docx
20K

@ Invoice Mayur Sitole.doc
73K

Mayur Shitole <shitolemayur96@gmail.com> Thu, May 16, 2024 at 10:44 PM
To: Editor 1JZI <editor_ijzi@hotmail.com>

Respected sir,

Thank you so much for the great news!

Great thank to you and all reviewers for considering my submitted manuscript for publication in your journal.

| will do the further process within 24 hrs and will send the said files within next 24 hrs.

Best regards,

Mr. Mayur Shitole

Assistant Professor,

Tuljaram Chaturchand College,
Baramati- 413102

[Quoted text hidden]

Mayur Shitole <shitolemayur96@gmail.com> Fri, May 17, 2024 at 8:14 PM
To: Editor 1JZI <editor_ijzi@hotmail.com>

Respected Sir,
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